
Love in the Spiral Matrix
Master Codes LOVE Beige Purple Red Blue Orange Green Yellow Turquoise Ultraviolet

Safety & Security, “Will I 
survive?”, instinct driven, 
needs protected environment, 
raw emotions

Beige

Tribe, Family, Culture, 
Tradition, Symbols, Magic, 
shamans, chieftans, ritual, fun 
play

Purple

Distinct self, ego, control, 
personal power, creative, learn 
cause and effect, daring, 
spontaneous, no guilt

Red

Order, rules, purpose, 
meaning, one right way, 
structure, guilt, good and evil, 
want approval, roles

Blue

Success, achieve, goals, 
competition, money, wealth, 
strive, expertise, play to win, 
self-authoring

Orange

Bonding, acceptance, 
sensitivity, diversity, 
consensus, equality, 
community

Green

Flex-Flow, big picture, 
technology, complexity, 
integration, Higher principles, 
inner clarity, decrease in fear

Yellow

Synergy, interdependence,   
WE experience, the “Good, 
True and Beautiful”, Oneness, 
Heart with head

Turquoise

Witness Self, deep Process, 
action/non-action without 
attachment to outcome, 
beyond rational mind, 
Compassion, Now

Ultraviolet


